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● Publicizing opportunities to serve on the DAC and SACs, and soliciting 

parents/guardians to serve. 
 
● Assisting school personnel in increasing parents’/guardians’ engagement with 

educators, including but not limited to parents’/guardians’ engagement in creating 
READ plans and individual career and academic plans for students, and plans to 
address students’ habitual truancy. 

 
● Developing training for District and school personnel concerning best practices 

and skills in working with parents/guardians. 
 
The Board of Education shall appoint one of its members to serve as a liaison to the 
DAC, and one of its members to serve as an alternate in the absence or inability to 
serve of the liaison. 
 
All voting members of the DAC shall serve two-year terms, which shall be staggered so 
that the terms of six members and five members expire in alternating years.  Voting 
members of the DAC shall be appointed by the Board of Education upon consideration 
of the DAC’s recommendation, and may be removed by the Board for any reason it 
deems sufficient.  The two-year term of any voting member of the DAC may be renewed 
at the discretion of the Board of Education, upon consideration of the DAC’s 
recommendation.   
 
Voting members of the DAC shall elect a parent representative to serve with the District 
administrator as co-chairperson.  The District administrator shall appoint a secretary to 
take the minutes of DAC meetings, which shall be maintained by the District 
administrator.  The term of office of the parent co-chairperson shall be one year, and 
may be renewed for succeeding one-year terms upon election by the voting members. 
 
The DAC shall meet at least once each month during the school year.  DAC meetings 
shall be open to the public, and meeting notices shall be posted in the entryway at the 
Johannsen Support Services Center and on the District’s website.   
 
DAC POWERS AND DUTIES 
 
The DAC shall work with the superintendent and/or superintendent’s designee to 
develop written recommendations for spending priorities to be included in the District’s 
annual budget.  In developing its written recommendations, the DAC shall seek and 
consider input from the SACs.  The DAC’s written recommendations shall be provided 
to the superintendent and/or superintendent’s designee on or before December 15 of 
each fiscal year, and the superintendent and/or superintendent’s designee shall forward 
the DAC’s recommendations to the Board of Education with the District’s preliminary 
budget. 
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to students with disabilities, students in the gifted and talented program, English 
language learners, ethnic minority students, etc.); (3) at least one adult member of an 
organization of parents, teachers and students recognized by the school (i.e., 
PTO/PTA); and (4) at least one person who is involved in business or industry in the 
community who is not a parent/guardian. 
 
In addition to the above-specified members, the principal may appoint additional 
members to the school’s SAC as long as the number of parents/guardians exceeds the 
number of representatives from the group with the next highest representation.  The 
Board’s intent is that no maximum shall be imposed on the number of parents/guardians 
of students attending a school who may be members of the school’s SAC. 
 
The term of office for all SAC members except the principal shall be one school year, 
which may be renewed for subsequent one-year terms, as determined by the principal.  
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Each SAC shall 


